
Category Items Item# Unit Town QuantityEstimated Vendor Unit Price Second Lowest Vendor Unit Price
Roadway Materials 4'x4' Precast Leaching Galley 208 EA Barnstable 10 Acme Shorey Precast $435.0000
Roadway Materials 4'x4' Precast Leaching Galley 208 EA Brewster 50 Acme Shorey Precast $435.0000
Roadway Materials 4'x4' Precast Leaching Galley 208 EA Dennis 20 Acme Shorey Precast $435.0000
Roadway Materials 4'x4' Precast Leaching Galley 208 EA Sandwich 8 Acme Shorey Precast $435.0000
Roadway Materials 4'x4' Precast Leaching Galley 208 EA Wellfleet 10 Acme Shorey Precast $435.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Catch Basin 209 EA Barnstable 10 Acme Shorey Precast $1,256.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Catch Basin 209 EA Bourne 10 Acme Shorey Precast $1,256.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Catch Basin 209 EA Brewster 25 Acme Shorey Precast $1,256.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Catch Basin 209 EA Dennis 5 Acme Shorey Precast $1,256.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Catch Basin 209 EA Falmouth 45 Acme Shorey Precast $1,256.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Catch Basin 209 EA Sandwich 5 Acme Shorey Precast $1,256.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Catch Basin 209 EA Wellfleet 5 Acme Shorey Precast $1,256.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Leach Pit 210 EA Barnstable 10 Acme Shorey Precast $928.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Leach Pit 210 EA Bourne 10 Acme Shorey Precast $928.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Leach Pit 210 EA Brewster 15 Acme Shorey Precast $928.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Leach Pit 210 EA Dennis 10 Acme Shorey Precast $928.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Leach Pit 210 EA Falmouth 50 Acme Shorey Precast $928.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Leach Pit 210 EA Sandwich 5 Acme Shorey Precast $928.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Leach Pit 210 EA Wellfleet 5 Acme Shorey Precast $928.0000
Roadway Materials 1000 Gallon Precast Leach Pit 210 EA Yarmouth 5 Acme Shorey Precast $928.0000
Roadway Materials 4' Diameter Precast Catch Basin w/Offset Top 211 EA Barnstable 5 Acme Shorey Precast $685.0000
Roadway Materials 4' Diameter Precast Catch Basin w/Offset Top 211 EA Bourne 5 Acme Shorey Precast $685.0000
Roadway Materials 4' Diameter Precast Catch Basin w/Offset Top 211 EA Brewster 15 Acme Shorey Precast $685.0000
Roadway Materials 4' Diameter Precast Catch Basin w/Offset Top 211 EA Dennis 10 Acme Shorey Precast $685.0000
Roadway Materials 4' Diameter Precast Catch Basin w/Offset Top 211 EA Falmouth 20 Acme Shorey Precast $685.0000
Roadway Materials 4' Diameter Precast Catch Basin w/Offset Top 211 EA Sandwich 5 Acme Shorey Precast $685.0000
Roadway Materials 4' Diameter Precast Catch Basin w/Offset Top 211 EA Wellfleet 4 Acme Shorey Precast $685.0000
Roadway Materials 4' Diameter Precast Catch Basin w/Offset Top 211 EA Yarmouth 5 Acme Shorey Precast $685.0000
Roadway Materials Precast Gutter Inlet 212 EA Barnstable 5 Acme Shorey Precast $300.0000
Roadway Materials Precast Gutter Inlet 212 EA Brewster 10 Acme Shorey Precast $3.0000
Roadway Materials Precast Gutter Inlet 212 EA Dennis 10 Acme Shorey Precast $300.0000
Roadway Materials Precast Gutter Inlet 212 EA Falmouth 25 Acme Shorey Precast $300.0000
Roadway Materials Precast Gutter Inlet 212 EA Sandwich 5 Acme Shorey Precast $300.0000
Roadway Materials Precast Gutter Inlet 212 EA Wellfleet 6 Acme Shorey Precast $300.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON Barnstable 750 Aggregate Industries $96.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON Brewster 500 Aggregate Industries $96.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON Dennis 500 Aggregate Industries $96.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON Harwich 200 Aggregate Industries $96.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON Orleans 100 Aggregate Industries $96.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON Sandwich 1000 Aggregate Industries $96.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON Wellfleet 250 Aggregate Industries $96.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON Yarmouth 500 Aggregate Industries $96.0000
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (20% Rubber) 11 SY Brewster 50000 All States Construction, Inc. $6.1500
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (20% Rubber) 11 SY Dennis 60000 All States Construction, Inc. $6.1500
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (20% Rubber) 11 SY Falmouth 15000 All States Construction, Inc. $6.1500
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (20% Rubber) 11 SY Orleans 27035 All States Construction, Inc. $6.1500
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (20% Rubber) 11 SY Sandwich 50000 All States Construction, Inc. $6.1500
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (20% Rubber) 11 SY Yarmouth 15000 All States Construction, Inc. $6.1500
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (10% Rubber) 12 SY Dennis 60000 All States Construction, Inc. $5.0500
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (10% Rubber) 12 SY Orleans 13316 All States Construction, Inc. $5.0500
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (10% Rubber) 12 SY Sandwich 70000 All States Construction, Inc. $5.0500
Road Construction Asphalt-Rubber Surface Treatment (10% Rubber) 12 SY Yarmouth 180000 All States Construction, Inc. $5.0500
Road Construction Single Stone Seal Surface Treatment 13 SY Falmouth 30000 All States Construction, Inc. $4.0500
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/  115 LF Barnstable 300 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $55.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/  115 LF Brewster 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $55.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/  115 LF Dennis 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $55.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/  115 LF Harwich 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $55.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/  115 LF Orleans 200 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $55.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/  115 LF Sandwich 100 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $55.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/  115 LF Wellfleet 2000 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $55.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/  115 LF Yarmouth 3000 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $55.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/         116 LF Barnstable 4000 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/         116 LF Brewster 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/         116 LF Dennis 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/         116 LF Harwich 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/         116 LF Orleans 200 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/         116 LF Sandwich 100 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail-Terminal End 117 EA Barnstable 80 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail-Terminal End 117 EA Brewster 12 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail-Terminal End 117 EA Dennis 10 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail-Terminal End 117 EA Harwich 10 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail-Terminal End 117 EA Orleans 4 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail-Terminal End 117 EA Sandwich 5 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail-Terminal End 117 EA Wellfleet 10 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam (Weathering) Highway Guardrail-Terminal End 117 EA Yarmouth 30 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/Wood Posts) 118 LF Barnstable 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $50.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/Wood Posts) 118 LF Falmouth 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $50.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/Wood Posts) 118 LF Orleans 20 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $50.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel Beam Highway Guardrail (Single Faced/Wood Posts) 118 LF Sandwich 100 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $50.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel-Backed Timber Guardrail 119 LF Barnstable 300 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $180.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel-Backed Timber Guardrail 119 LF Brewster 250 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $180.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel-Backed Timber Guardrail 119 LF Dennis 200 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $180.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Steel-Backed Timber Guardrail 119 LF Sandwich 100 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $180.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Wooden Guardrail 120 LF Barnstable 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Wooden Guardrail 120 LF Brewster 250 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Wooden Guardrail 120 LF Dennis 200 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Wooden Guardrail 120 LF Falmouth 500 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Wooden Guardrail 120 LF Orleans 275 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Wooden Guardrail 120 LF Sandwich 100 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Wooden Guardrail 120 LF Yarmouth 1400 Bartlett Consolidated DE LLC $65.0000
Roadway Materials 1-1/2" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 203 TON Barnstable 100 Cape Cod Aggregates Corp. $33.5000
Roadway Materials 1-1/2" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 203 TON Falmouth 1500 Cape Cod Aggregates Corp. $32.2500
Roadway Materials 1-1/2" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 203 TON Sandwich 200 Cape Cod Aggregates Corp. $31.0000
Roadway Materials 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 206 TON Falmouth 2000 Cape Cod Aggregates Corp. $28.2500
Roadway Materials 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 206 TON JBCC 200 Cape Cod Aggregates Corp. $30.0000
Roadway Materials 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 206 TON Orleans 250 Cape Cod Aggregates Corp. $31.0000
Roadway Materials 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 206 TON Sandwich 200 Cape Cod Aggregates Corp. $27.0000



Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Cover w/1 inch vent hole 213 EA Brewster 24 Cape Cod Winwater $697.6700
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Cover w/1 inch vent hole 213 EA Dennis 5 Cape Cod Winwater $697.6700
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Cover w/1 inch vent hole 213 EA Falmouth 50 Cape Cod Winwater $697.6700
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Cover w/1 inch vent hole 213 EA Sandwich 20 Cape Cod Winwater $697.6700
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Cover w/1 inch vent hole 213 EA Wellfleet 12 Cape Cod Winwater $697.6700
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Grate Municipal Standard 214 EA Barnstable 15 Cape Cod Winwater $636.5500
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Grate Municipal Standard 214 EA Brewster 24 Cape Cod Winwater $636.5500
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Grate Municipal Standard 214 EA Dennis 10 Cape Cod Winwater $636.5500
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Grate Municipal Standard 214 EA Falmouth 50 Cape Cod Winwater $636.5500
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Grate Municipal Standard 214 EA Sandwich 20 Cape Cod Winwater $636.5500
Roadway Materials 8" Frame and Grate Municipal Standard 214 EA Wellfleet 12 Cape Cod Winwater $636.5500
Roadway Materials 12" Hood 215 EA Brewster 36 Cape Cod Winwater $319.7500
Roadway Materials 12" Hood 215 EA Dennis 10 Cape Cod Winwater $319.7500
Roadway Materials 12" Hood 215 EA Falmouth 25 Cape Cod Winwater $319.7500
Roadway Materials 12" Hood 215 EA Sandwich 10 Cape Cod Winwater $319.7500
Roadway Materials 12" Hood 215 EA Wellfleet 12 Cape Cod Winwater $319.7500
Roadway Materials 12" Corrugated Plastic (Polyethylene) Pipe 217 LF Barnstable 100 Cape Cod Winwater $13.8200
Roadway Materials 12" Corrugated Plastic (Polyethylene) Pipe 217 LF Brewster 200 Cape Cod Winwater $13.8200
Roadway Materials 12" Corrugated Plastic (Polyethylene) Pipe 217 LF Dennis 500 Cape Cod Winwater $13.8200
Roadway Materials 12" Corrugated Plastic (Polyethylene) Pipe 217 LF Falmouth 250 Cape Cod Winwater $13.8200
Roadway Materials 12" Corrugated Plastic (Polyethylene) Pipe 217 LF Orleans 300 Cape Cod Winwater $13.8200
Roadway Materials 12" Corrugated Plastic (Polyethylene) Pipe 217 LF Sandwich 200 Cape Cod Winwater $13.8200
Roadway Materials 12" Corrugated Plastic (Polyethylene) Pipe 217 LF Wellfleet 500 Cape Cod Winwater $13.8200
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Greater than 40 Ton 2 TON Brewster 300 Coastal Paving LLC $220.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $280.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Less than 40 Tons/D 3 TON Brewster 300 Coastal Paving LLC $260.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $320.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Less than 40 Tons/D 3 TON Harwich 100 Coastal Paving LLC $260.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $300.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Pave Shield Pavement Sealing (1500 Square Yards or Great 123 SY Barnstable 5000 Coastal Paving LLC $1.8000
Miscellaneous Public Works Pave Shield Pavement Sealing (1500 Square Yards or Great 123 SY Brewster 12000 Coastal Paving LLC $1.8000
Miscellaneous Public Works Pave Shield Pavement Sealing (1500 Square Yards or Great 123 SY Dennis 6000 Coastal Paving LLC $1.8000
Miscellaneous Public Works Pave Shield Pavement Sealing (1500 Square Yards or Great 123 SY Sandwich 5000 Coastal Paving LLC $1.8000
Miscellaneous Public Works Pave Shield Pavement Sealing (1500 Square Yards or Great 123 SY Yarmouth 1500 Coastal Paving LLC $4.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Pave Shield Pavement Sealing (Under 1500 Square Yards) 124 SY Dennis 1000 Coastal Paving LLC $4.3500
Miscellaneous Public Works Pave Shield Pavement Sealing (Under 1500 Square Yards) 124 SY JBCC 500 Coastal Paving LLC $4.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Rubber Crackfiller 126 GAL Barnstable 15000 Coastal Paving LLC $17.7500
Road Construction Cold Planed (Milled) Paving Joints 8 SY Bourne 5000 Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming $50.0000
Road Construction Cold Planed (Milled) Paving Joints 8 SY Brewster 500 Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming $40.0000
Road Construction Cold Planed (Milled) Paving Joints 8 SY Dennis 600 Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming $35.0000
Road Construction Cold Planed (Milled) Paving Joints 8 SY Falmouth 200 Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming $60.0000
Road Construction Cold Planed (Milled) Paving Joints 8 SY Sandwich 250 Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming $50.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON Falmouth 4000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $125.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $139.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON Harwich 1000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $130.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $131.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON JBCC 300 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $164.0000 PJ Keating $250.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Greater than 40 Ton 2 TON Dennis 500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $280.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Greater than 40 Ton 2 TON Falmouth 250 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $211.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Greater than 40 Ton 2 TON Harwich 100 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $280.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Greater than 40 Ton 2 TON Sandwich 150 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $230.5000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Greater than 40 Ton 2 TON Yarmouth 100 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $280.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Less than 40 Tons/D 3 TON Bourne 1000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $320.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Less than 40 Tons/D 3 TON Dennis 500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $320.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Less than 40 Tons/D 3 TON Falmouth 200 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $230.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Less than 40 Tons/D 3 TON Orleans 80 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $285.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Less than 40 Tons/D 3 TON Wellfleet 200 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $330.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Less than 40 Tons/D 3 TON Yarmouth 120 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $320.0000
Road Construction Bituminous Concrete Excavation by Cold Planer 7 SY Falmouth 10000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $3.3000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $3.5000
Road Construction Bituminous Concrete Excavation by Cold Planer 7 SY Orleans 4739 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $3.3000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $3.5000
Road Construction Cold Planed (Milled) Paving Joints 8 SY Orleans 76 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $50.0000
Road Construction Porous Pavement Full Depth Construction 15 SY Dennis 1500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $165.0000
Road Construction Porous Pavement Full Depth Construction 15 SY Yarmouth 500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $165.0000
Road Construction Porous Pavement Sidewalk Construction 16 SY Dennis 500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $250.0000
Road Construction Partial Depth Pavement Patch 18 SY Dennis 600 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $58.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $60.0000
Road Construction Partial Depth Pavement Patch 18 SY JBCC 300 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $66.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $75.0000
Road Construction Partial Depth Pavement Patch 18 SY Orleans 12550 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $44.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $58.0000
Road Construction Partial Depth Pavement Patch 18 SY Yarmouth 1500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $58.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $59.0000
Road Construction Miscellaneous Pavement Patch 19 TON Bourne 1000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $375.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $400.0000
Road Construction Miscellaneous Pavement Patch 19 TON Dennis 200 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $315.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $400.0000
Road Construction Miscellaneous Pavement Patch 19 TON Falmouth 175 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $369.0000  
Road Construction Miscellaneous Pavement Patch 19 TON JBCC 100 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $310.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $400.0000
Road Construction Miscellaneous Pavement Patch 19 TON Yarmouth 200 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $315.0000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $400.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Adjusted 113 EA Barnstable 100 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $958.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Adjusted 113 EA Bourne 25 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $958.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Adjusted 113 EA Brewster 25 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $958.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Adjusted 113 EA Dennis 25 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $958.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Adjusted 113 EA Falmouth 50 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $958.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Adjusted 113 EA Orleans 37 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $958.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Adjusted 113 EA Sandwich 100 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $958.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Adjusted 113 EA Yarmouth 15 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $958.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Rebuilt 114 EA Barnstable 25 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $1,050.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Rebuilt 114 EA Bourne 25 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $1,050.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Rebuilt 114 EA Brewster 100 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $1,050.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Rebuilt 114 EA Dennis 20 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $1,050.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Rebuilt 114 EA Falmouth 25 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $1,050.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Rebuilt 114 EA Orleans 4 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $1,050.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Rebuilt 114 EA Sandwich 20 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $1,050.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Rebuilt 114 EA Yarmouth 15 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $1,050.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Granite Curb Type VB-Straight 121 LF Barnstable 300 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $82.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Granite Curb Type VB-Straight 121 LF Brewster 250 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $82.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Granite Curb Type VB-Straight 121 LF Dennis 750 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $82.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Granite Curb Type VB-Straight 121 LF Falmouth 500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $82.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Granite Curb Type VB-Straight 121 LF Sandwich 300 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $82.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Granite Curb Type VA4-Straight 122 LF Barnstable 300 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $82.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Granite Curb Type VA4-Straight 122 LF Sandwich 600 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $82.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON Falmouth 500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $89.0000
Roadway Materials Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Loaded on Town Trucks) 200 TON JBCC 100 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $89.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Barnstable 2200000 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Bourne 175000 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Brewster 600000 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Dennis 500000 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Falmouth 850000 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850



Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Harwich 1100000 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Orleans 374398 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Sandwich 150000 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Wellfleet 100000 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for 4" Reflectorized Li 100 LF Yarmouth 1000000 MARKINGS INC. $0.0850
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Barnstable 45000 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Bourne 5000 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Brewster 7000 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Dennis 500 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Falmouth 20000 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Harwich 1500 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Orleans 1100 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Sandwich 1500 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Wellfleet 2000 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Stop Bars & Crossw 101 LF Yarmouth 4000 MARKINGS INC. $0.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Arrows & Miscellan  102 SF Barnstable 11250 MARKINGS INC. $2.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Arrows & Miscellan  102 SF Bourne 5000 MARKINGS INC. $2.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Arrows & Miscellan  102 SF Brewster 3000 MARKINGS INC. $2.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Arrows & Miscellan  102 SF Falmouth 10000 MARKINGS INC. $2.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Arrows & Miscellan  102 SF Harwich 200 MARKINGS INC. $2.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Arrows & Miscellan  102 SF Orleans 3500 MARKINGS INC. $2.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Arrows & Miscellan  102 SF Sandwich 200 MARKINGS INC. $2.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Chlorinated Rubber Paint and Beads for Arrows & Miscellan  102 SF Yarmouth 2500 MARKINGS INC. $2.2500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for 4" Reflectorized Lines 103 LF Barnstable 28000 MARKINGS INC. $0.5500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for 4" Reflectorized Lines 103 LF Bourne 50000 MARKINGS INC. $0.5500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for 4" Reflectorized Lines 103 LF Dennis 80000 MARKINGS INC. $0.5500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for 4" Reflectorized Lines 103 LF Harwich 1000 MARKINGS INC. $0.5500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for 4" Reflectorized Lines 103 LF Sandwich 10000 MARKINGS INC. $0.5500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for 4" Reflectorized Lines 103 LF Wellfleet 5000 MARKINGS INC. $0.5500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Stop Bars & Crosswalks 104 LF Barnstable 500 MARKINGS INC. $3.9500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Stop Bars & Crosswalks 104 LF Bourne 2500 MARKINGS INC. $3.9500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Stop Bars & Crosswalks 104 LF Dennis 2000 MARKINGS INC. $3.9500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Stop Bars & Crosswalks 104 LF Harwich 1000 MARKINGS INC. $3.9500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Stop Bars & Crosswalks 104 LF Sandwich 500 MARKINGS INC. $3.9500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Stop Bars & Crosswalks 104 LF Wellfleet 1000 MARKINGS INC. $3.9500
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Arrows & Miscellaneous Markings 105 SF Barnstable 500 MARKINGS INC. $6.9400
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Arrows & Miscellaneous Markings 105 SF Bourne 2500 MARKINGS INC. $6.9400
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Arrows & Miscellaneous Markings 105 SF Dennis 300 MARKINGS INC. $6.9400
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Arrows & Miscellaneous Markings 105 SF Harwich 100 MARKINGS INC. $6.9400
Miscellaneous Public Works Thermoplastic Paint for Arrows & Miscellaneous Markings 105 SF Sandwich 100 MARKINGS INC. $6.9400
Miscellaneous Public Works Epoxy Paint for 4" Reflectorized Lines 106 LF Barnstable 4000 MARKINGS INC. $0.4300
Miscellaneous Public Works Epoxy Paint for 4" Reflectorized Lines 106 LF Dennis 300000 MARKINGS INC. $0.4300
Miscellaneous Public Works Epoxy Paint for 4" Reflectorized Lines 106 LF Sandwich 5000 MARKINGS INC. $0.4300
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal 107 SF Barnstable 10000 MARKINGS INC. $1.7300
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal 107 SF Brewster 1000 MARKINGS INC. $1.7300
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal 107 SF Dennis 5000 MARKINGS INC. $1.7300
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal 107 SF Falmouth 2500 MARKINGS INC. $1.7300
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal 107 SF Orleans 500 MARKINGS INC. $1.7300
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal 107 SF Sandwich 1000 MARKINGS INC. $1.7300
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal 107 SF Yarmouth 500 MARKINGS INC. $1.7300
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON Brewster 5000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $129.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $130.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON Dennis 3000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $126.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $129.7000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON Orleans 1681 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $127.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $133.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON Wellfleet 3000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $137.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $140.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON Yarmouth 500 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $129.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $133.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Shim) 4 TON Brewster 2000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $136.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $146.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Shim) 4 TON Dennis 3000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $135.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $146.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Shim) 4 TON Orleans 50 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $134.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $146.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Shim) 4 TON Sandwich 1500 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $134.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $140.0000
Road Construction Bituminous Concrete Excavation by Cold Planer 7 SY Brewster 10000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $2.9500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $3.7500
Road Construction Bituminous Concrete Excavation by Cold Planer 7 SY Dennis 5000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $2.9500 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $3.4000
Road Construction Bituminous Concrete Excavation by Cold Planer 7 SY Sandwich 5000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $3.5000 PJ Keating $3.7900
Road Construction Bituminous Concrete Excavation by Cold Planer 7 SY Yarmouth 4000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $3.5000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp. $4.2700
Road Construction Partial Depth Pavement Patch 18 SY Bourne 10000 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $55.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $68.0000
Road Construction Partial Depth Pavement Patch 18 SY Harwich 500 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $60.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $66.0000
Road Construction Partial Depth Pavement Patch 18 SY Sandwich 500 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $60.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $68.0000
Road Construction Miscellaneous Pavement Patch 19 TON Harwich 100 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $400.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $420.0000
Road Construction Miscellaneous Pavement Patch 19 TON Sandwich 100 MCE Dirtworks, Inc. $400.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $420.0000
Road Construction Pavement Reclamation (Including FG&C) 5 SY Brewster 3500 murray paving & reclamation inc $3.9000 Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming $5.1900
Road Construction Pavement Reclamation (Including FG&C) 5 SY Dennis 6000 murray paving & reclamation inc $2.8200 Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming $4.5000
Road Construction Pavement Reclamation (Including FG&C) 5 SY Falmouth 4000 murray paving & reclamation inc $3.4500 Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming $5.1900
Road Construction Pavement Reclamation (Including FG&C) 5 SY JBCC 2500 murray paving & reclamation inc $3.7500 Garrity Asphalt Reclaiming $5.7500
Road Construction Pavement Reclamation (Including FG&C and Calcium Chlor 6 SY Brewster 3500 murray paving & reclamation inc $5.1500 All States Construction, Inc. $7.0000
Road Construction Pavement Reclamation (Including FG&C and Calcium Chlor 6 SY Orleans 5322 murray paving & reclamation inc $4.3800 All States Construction, Inc. $4.7500
Road Construction Pavement Reclamation (Including FG&C and Calcium Chlor 6 SY Sandwich 10000 murray paving & reclamation inc $3.4500 All States Construction, Inc. $4.2500
Road Construction Bituminous Pavement Repair Infra-Red Method 17 SY Brewster 250 No Bid No Bid
Road Construction Bituminous Pavement Repair Infra-Red Method 17 SY Dennis 750 No Bid No Bid
Road Construction Bituminous Pavement Repair Infra-Red Method 17 SY Falmouth 100 No Bid No Bid
Road Construction Bituminous Pavement Repair Infra-Red Method 17 SY Orleans 100 No Bid No Bid
Road Construction Velocity Spray Injection Pothole Repair 20 DAY Harwich 10 No Bid No Bid
Road Construction Textured Synthetic Pavement 23 SY Brewster 100 No Bid No Bid
Road Construction Textured Synthetic Pavement 23 SY Dennis 200 No Bid No Bid
Road Construction Textured Synthetic Pavement 23 SY Sandwich 100 No Bid No Bid
Roadway Materials 12" Reinforced Concrete Pipe 216 EA Brewster 6 No Bid No Bid
Roadway Materials 12" Reinforced Concrete Pipe 216 EA Dennis 100 No Bid No Bid
Roadway Materials 12" Reinforced Concrete Pipe 216 LF Sandwich 100 No Bid No Bid
Roadway Materials Riprap 218 CY Falmouth 100 No Bid No Bid
Roadway Materials Riprap 218 CY JBCC 100 No Bid No Bid
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal for Items 101, 102, 104 & 105  107A SF Barnstable 10000 No Bid No Bid
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal for Items 101, 102, 104 & 105  107A SF Brewster 500 No Bid No Bid
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal for Items 101, 102, 104 & 105  107A SF Dennis 500 No Bid No Bid
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal for Items 101, 102, 104 & 105  107A SF Falmouth 200 No Bid No Bid
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal for Items 101, 102, 104 & 105  107A SF Orleans 500 No Bid No Bid
Miscellaneous Public Works Pavement Marking Removal for Items 101, 102, 104 & 105  107A SF Sandwich 500 No Bid No Bid
Miscellaneous Public Works Dranage Pipe Cleaning 108A DAY Brewster 2 No Bid No Bid
Roadway Materials Sand Borrow 201 TON Barnstable 500 P.A. Landers, Inc. $25.5000
Roadway Materials Sand Borrow 201 TON Brewster 2000 P.A. Landers, Inc. $26.7500
Roadway Materials Sand Borrow 201 TON Dennis 200 P.A. Landers, Inc. $26.0000



Roadway Materials Sand Borrow 201 TON Falmouth 300 P.A. Landers, Inc. $24.5000
Roadway Materials Sand Borrow 201 TON Orleans 100 P.A. Landers, Inc. $27.7500
Roadway Materials Sand Borrow 201 TON Sandwich 200 P.A. Landers, Inc. $23.5000
Roadway Materials Sand Borrow 201 TON Wellfleet 500 P.A. Landers, Inc. $28.5000
Roadway Materials 1-1/2" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 203 TON Brewster 2000 P.A. Landers, Inc. $34.7500
Roadway Materials 1-1/2" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 203 TON Dennis 500 P.A. Landers, Inc. $34.5000
Roadway Materials 1-1/2" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 203 TON Orleans 50 P.A. Landers, Inc. $35.7500
Roadway Materials 1-1/2" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 203 TON Wellfleet 100 P.A. Landers, Inc. $37.0000
Roadway Materials 1-1/2" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 203 TON Yarmouth 500 P.A. Landers, Inc. $34.2500
Roadway Materials 3/4" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 204 TON Barnstable 50 P.A. Landers, Inc. $33.7500
Roadway Materials 3/4" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 204 TON Bourne 1000 P.A. Landers, Inc. $32.7500
Roadway Materials 3/4" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 204 TON Brewster 250 P.A. Landers, Inc. $34.7500
Roadway Materials 3/4" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 204 TON Dennis 500 P.A. Landers, Inc. $34.5000
Roadway Materials 3/4" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 204 TON Orleans 50 P.A. Landers, Inc. $35.7500
Roadway Materials 3/4" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 204 TON Wellfleet 100 P.A. Landers, Inc. $37.0000
Roadway Materials 3/8" Peastone (Double Washed) 205 TON Barnstable 50 P.A. Landers, Inc. $34.7500
Roadway Materials 3/8" Peastone (Double Washed) 205 TON Bourne 500 P.A. Landers, Inc. $33.7500
Roadway Materials 3/8" Peastone (Double Washed) 205 TON Brewster 250 P.A. Landers, Inc. $35.7500
Roadway Materials 3/8" Peastone (Double Washed) 205 TON Dennis 200 P.A. Landers, Inc. $34.7500
Roadway Materials 3/8" Peastone (Double Washed) 205 TON Orleans 50 P.A. Landers, Inc. $36.5000
Roadway Materials 3/8" Peastone (Double Washed) 205 TON Sandwich 200 P.A. Landers, Inc. $32.7500
Roadway Materials 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 206 TON Brewster 500 P.A. Landers, Inc. $33.5000
Roadway Materials 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 206 TON Dennis 1500 P.A. Landers, Inc. $33.0000
Roadway Materials 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 206 TON Wellfleet 100 P.A. Landers, Inc. $35.5000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON Bourne 5000 PJ Keating $111.7400 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $125.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Machine Placed) 1 TON Sandwich 2500 PJ Keating $113.9400 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $125.0000
Road Construction Hot Mix Asphalt Pavement (Handwork Greater than 40 Ton 2 TON Bourne 1000 PJ Keating $248.0000 Lawrence-Lynch Corp $264.0000
Road Construction Bituminous Concrete Excavation by Cold Planer 7 SY Bourne 50000 PJ Keating $1.9200 Rafferty Fine Grading, Inc. $2.6800
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Pipe Cleaning with Basin Cleaning 108 DAY Brewster 5 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $6,500.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Pipe Cleaning 108 DAY Dennis 5 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $2,800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Pipe Cleaning 108 DAY Falmouth 5 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $2,800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Pipe Cleaning 108 DAY Orleans 3 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $3,500.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Pipe Cleaning 108 DAY Sandwich 5 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $2,800.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Pipe Cleaning 108 DAY Wellfleet 5 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $4,000.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Clamshell (w/Disposal) 109 EA Barnstable 2000 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $58.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Clamshell (w/Disposal) 109 EA Brewster 950 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $40.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Clamshell (w/Disposal) 109 EA Dennis 1550 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $40.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Clamshell (w/Disposal) 109 EA Falmouth 100 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $120.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Clamshell (w/Disposal) 109 EA Sandwich 2000 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $45.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Clamshell (w/o Disposal) 110 EA Sandwich 2000 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $25.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/Disposa 111 EA Barnstable 2000 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $225.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/Disposa 111 EA Brewster 25 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $370.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/Disposa 111 EA Dennis 100 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $260.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/Disposa 111 EA Falmouth 100 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $260.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/Disposa 111 EA Orleans 30 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $350.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/Disposa 111 EA Sandwich 500 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $250.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/o Dispo 112 EA Harwich 200 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $250.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/o Dispo 112 EA Orleans 30 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $250.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/o Dispo 112 EA Sandwich 500 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $200.0000
Miscellaneous Public Works Drainage Structure Cleaning By Vaccuum Truck (w/o Dispo 112 EA Wellfleet 30 R.J. GABRIEL CONST. CO. INC. $250.0000
Roadway Materials Loam Borrow 202 TON Falmouth 200 Robert B Our Co Inc $24.5000
Roadway Materials Loam Borrow 202 TON Wellfleet 100 Robert B Our Co Inc $24.5000
Roadway Materials Loam Borrow 202 TON Barnstable 500 Robert Childs Inc. $20.0000
Roadway Materials Loam Borrow 202 TON Brewster 500 Robert Childs Inc. $19.0000
Roadway Materials Loam Borrow 202 TON Dennis 500 Robert Childs Inc. $19.0000
Roadway Materials Loam Borrow 202 TON Orleans 100 Robert Childs Inc. $20.0000
Roadway Materials Loam Borrow 202 TON Sandwich 200 Robert Childs Inc. $20.0000
Roadway Materials 1-1/2" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 203 TON Bourne 1000 Robert Childs Inc. $30.7500
Roadway Materials 3/4" Crushed Stone (Double Washed) 204 TON Sandwich 200 Robert Childs Inc. $29.0000
Roadway Materials 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 206 TON Barnstable 500 Robert Childs Inc. $29.0000
Roadway Materials 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 206 TON Yarmouth 1500 Robert Childs Inc. $29.0000
Roadway Materials Recycled Asphalt 207 TON Brewster 500 Robert Childs Inc. $18.0000
Roadway Materials Recycled Asphalt 207 TON Dennis 1500 Robert Childs Inc. $16.0000
Roadway Materials Recycled Asphalt 207 TON Orleans 100 Robert Childs Inc. $18.0000
Roadway Materials Recycled Asphalt 207 TON Sandwich 200 Robert Childs Inc. $18.0000
Roadway Materials Recycled Asphalt 207 TON Wellfleet 500 Robert Childs Inc. $23.0000
Roadway Materials Riprap 218 CY Barnstable 500 Robert Childs Inc. $29.5000
Roadway Materials Riprap 218 CY Bourne 100 Robert Childs Inc. $24.0000
Roadway Materials Riprap 218 CY Brewster 50 Robert Childs Inc. $32.0000
Roadway Materials Riprap 218 CY Dennis 200 Robert Childs Inc. $31.0000
Roadway Materials Riprap 218 CY Orleans 100 Robert Childs Inc. $34.0000
Roadway Materials Riprap 218 CY Sandwich 100 Robert Childs Inc. $31.0000
Roadway Materials Riprap 218 CY Wellfleet 50 Robert Childs Inc. $41.0000
Road Construction Microsurfacing (Two Lifts) 10 SY Falmouth 30000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $6.4700
Road Construction Cape Seal w/Double Stone Seal Surface Treatment 22 SY Falmouth 30000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $12.9700
Miscellaneous Public Works Pave Shield Pavement Sealing (Under 1500 Square Yards) 124 SY Barnstable 1500 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $5.9500
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Barnstable 15000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.0700
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Bourne 4500 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.0700
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Brewster 5000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.6100
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Dennis 10000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.6100
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Falmouth 200 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.0700
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Harwich 5000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.6100
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Orleans 2892 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.6200
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Sandwich 7000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.0700
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Wellfleet 3000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.7200
Miscellaneous Public Works Modified Asphalt-Fiber Crackfiller 125 GAL Yarmouth 5000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $13.6100
Miscellaneous Public Works Rubber Crackfiller 126 GAL Bourne 5000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $22.8500
Miscellaneous Public Works Rubber Crackfiller 126 GAL Brewster 5000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $23.7000
Miscellaneous Public Works Rubber Crackfiller 126 GAL Dennis 1000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $23.7000
Miscellaneous Public Works Rubber Crackfiller 126 GAL Harwich 500 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $23.7000
Miscellaneous Public Works Rubber Crackfiller 126 GAL JBCC 250 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $38.2900
Miscellaneous Public Works Rubber Crackfiller 126 GAL Sandwich 1000 Sealcoating, Inc. d/b/a indus $22.8500
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