
Contract BC-25-8073
Fertilizers

Product Manufacturer Vendor
Number of Pounds Per 
Bag/ Gallons per Case

Price per Bag (Dry), 
Price Per Case (Liquid) Applied

Bulk Size Number of 
Pounds or Gallons Bulk Size Price Total Cost per unit

0-0-7 .067% Acelepryn .167% 
Dimension in 150 SGN Lebanon

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions 
Company 50 $62.00 $1.24

12-0-12 Greens Grade Lebanon Heritage PPG 50 $58.50 $1.17

12-0-12 SeaBlend Ocean Organics
Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions 50 $66.00 $1.32

12-4-5 SeaBlend Ocean Organics
Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions 50 $62.00 $1.24

14-2-4   Seablend Ocean Organics
Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions 50 $62.00 $1.24

15-0-8 for fairways and roughs Lebanon Heritage PPG 50 $56.40 $67.25 $1.13
15-3-9  Mini Fairway Grade Sustane Heritage PPG 50 $60.50 $81.81 $1.21
17-9-17 Mini Starter w/Isodore Winfield Heritage PPG 50 $55.33 $68.33 $1.11
18-0-9 polycoat w/ Dimension Anderson's Heritage PPG 50 $37.20 $53.45 $0.74

18-2-18 IBDU Mid Size Lebanon Seaboard No Bid

19-0-19 IBDU Mid Size Lebanon Seaboard Heritage PPG 50 $57.50 $70.50 $1.15
19-0-19 Mini w/Isodure Winfield Heritage PPG 50 $57.50 $70.50 $1.15
19-0-6 30XCU .15 Dimension Nutrite Heritage PPG 50 $23.50 $36.50 $0.47
21-0-16 Micro w/Isodore Winfield Heritage PPG 50 $65.00 $1.30
21-0-4 polycoat w/Merit Anderson's No Bid
24-0-5 with Microsurge Nutrite Heritage PPG 50 $24.50 $44.50 $0.49
26-0-13 Mini w/Isodure Winfield Heritage PPG 50 $61.33 $80.45 $1.23
26-0-5 ACE/DIM SGN
145- with EPEC Coated Nitrogen EC Grow Heritage PPG 50 $82.20 $96.65 $1.64

26-0-5 w/Dimension & Acelepryn EC Grow Heritage PPG 50 $82.20 $96.65 $1.64
26-3-13 IBDU N/A Heritage PPG 50 $61.33 $80.45 $1.23
28-0-14 Mini 
w/Isodure/Methydure Winfield Heritage PPG 50 $60.00 $81.65 $1.20
28-0-14 Multi N Winfield Heritage PPG 50 $60.00 $81.65 $1.20
29-0-7 98% Polyon w.1 
Dimension Harrell's Harrell's, LLC 50 $62.20 $1.24
30-0-10 Fairway Grade Harrell's Harrell's, LLC 50 $46.89 $0.94
30-0-10 w/Dimension Harrell's Harrell's, LLC 50 $49.02 $0.98
30-0-7 70% Polyon w.1 
Dimension Harrell's No Bid
3-3-3 Myco Replenish Green 
grade Earthworks Tom Irwin, Inc. 50 $59.90 $1.20

34-0-4 w/Dimension & Acelepryn Shaws/Award
The Charles C. Hart Seed 
Co. 50 $96.55 $1.93

5-4-5 Organic Greens Grade Earthworks Tom Irwin, Inc. 50 $58.50 $1.17
5-4-5 Replenish Green grade Earthworks Tom Irwin, Inc. 50 $58.50 $1.17

5-7-5 SeaBlend Super Starter Ocean Organics

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions 
Company 50 $66.00 $1.32

7-7-7 Greens Grade
GRIGG (Seven 
Iron) Heritage PPG 50 $76.82 $1.54

Gravity S Microsurge Heritage Heritage PPG 25 $171.82 $6.87
Renovate plus 1-0-1 Earthworks Tom Irwin, Inc. 50 $71.50 $1.43

18-3-6 with micros N/A

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions 
Company 5 $70.00 $14.00

19-0-6 with Kelp 30%SRN
Ferti Technologies 
for Winfield Heritage PPG 55 $687.50 275 $2,887.50 $12.50

28-0-0 Corteva Heritage PPG 5 $92.85 260 $3,915.60 $18.57

30-0-0 N/A

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions 
Company 30 $375.00 275 $2,750.00 $12.50

Gravity L 38 Special Heritage Heritage PPG 5 $362.50 260 $17,760.30 $72.50
Liquid iron (FE) N/A Heritage PPG 5 $62.50 260 $3,250.00 $12.50

DRY PRODUCTS

LIQUID PRODUCTS



Contract # BC-25-8073
Fungicides/Herbicides

Product Manufacturer Vendor

Bag Size lbs (Dry), 
Ounces per bottle 

(Liquid)

Price per bag 
(Dry)/ Price per 
Bottle (Liquid)

Bulk Size in lbs 
(Dry)/ Gallons per 

case (Liquid)

Bulk Size Price 
(Dry)/ Price per 
case (Liquid) Total Unit Cost

Boscalid Quali Pro Heritage PPG 0.49 $77.63 4.9 $776.30 $158.43
Compass WG Bayer Nutrien Ag Solutions 1 $546.74 4 $2,186.96 $546.74

Dimension WSP Corteva
Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 320 $613.00 $1.92

Mancozeb DG Lesco Nutrien Ag Solutions 6 $31.44 48 $1,509.12 $5.24
Pro-Star 70 WSP Bayer Heritage PPG 320 $875.00 640 $1,750.00 $2.73
Terrazole WP OHP Heritage PPG 32 $138.28 12 $829.68 $4.32

Velocity 17.6SG Nufarm
Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 16 $533.50 128 $4,250.00 $33.34

Acclaim Extra Bayer Heritage PPG 16 $103.08 128 $772.73 $6.44
Aluminum tris Several Heritage PPG 88 $116.36 352 $465.44 $1.32

Chipco 26GT Bayer
Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 320 $549.64 $1.72

Compass 50 WG Bayer Nutrien Ag Solutions 1 $546.74 4 $2,186.96 $546.74

Confront Corteva
Atlantic Golf and Turf an 
Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 128 $57.75 4 $230.00 $0.45

Drive XLR8 BASF Heritage PPG 64 $54.91 320 $284.20 $0.86
Eagle 20 EW Corteva Heritage PPG 128 $184.68 $1.44
Enclave Quali Pro Harrell's, LLC 320 $305.00 $0.95
Fluazinam Several Heritage PPG 128 $328.98 256 $657.96 $2.57
Tebuconazole 3.6F Foliar Quali Pro Heritage PPG 128 $54.40 512 $217.60 $0.43
Trinity BASF No bid
Tytlephyte Harrells Harrell's, LLC 320 $232.54 30 $2,639.25 $0.73
Zero-Tol Bio Safe Systems Heritage PPG 320 $93.05 30 $1,048.50 $0.29

LIQUID PRODUCTS

DRY PRODUCTS



Contract BC‐25‐8073

Insecticides

Product Manufacturer Vendor

Bag Size in lbs. 

(Dry)/ Gallons Per 

Case (liquid)

Price Per Bag (Dry)/ 

Case (Liquid)

Bulk Size in lbs 

(Dry)/ Gallons per 

drum (Liquid)

Bulk Price (Dry) Price 

per drum (Liquid) Total Unit Cost

Dylox Bayer Nutrien Ag Solutions 30 $48.90 $1.63

Merit 75 WSP N/A Nutrien Ag Solutions 6.4 $25.65 $4.01

Scimitar Syngenta The Charles C. Hart Seed Co. 32 $190.00 2 $1,520.00 $5.94

Bifenthrin N/A The Charles C. Hart Seed Co. 128 $32.15 4 $128.60 $0.25

DRY PRODUCTS

LIQUID PRODUCTS



Contract BC‐25‐8073

Wetting Agents

Product Manufacturer Vendor

Bag Size in lbs. (Dry)/ 

Gallons per case 

(Liquid)

Price per bag/ 

Case Applied Price

Bulk size in lbs. 

(Dry)/ Gallons per 

drum (Liquid)

Bulk Price/ Price 

per Drum Total Unit Cost

Calcitic Lime N/A

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 

Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 50 $7.90 $0.16

Dolomitic lime N/A

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 

Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 50 $7.09 $0.14

Hi Cal Lime N/A Heritage PPG 50 $8.50 $16.50 2000 $400.00 $0.17

Sili‐Cal Green Grade Tom Irwin No bid

Cal‐Turf Old Castle Heritage PPG 50 $19.25 $32.25 2000 $457.32 $0.39

Mag‐Turf Old Castle Heritage PPG 50 $19.25 $32.25 2000 $468.81 $0.39

16/90 Aquatrols Nutrien Ag Solutions 2.5 $148.95 $59.58

Aquicare Heritage Heritage PPG 5 $472.50 30 $2,572.50 $94.50

Aquisync Heritage Heritage PPG 5 $322.50 30 $1,845.00 $64.50

Base‐Cal Tom Irwin Tom Irwin, Inc. 5 $359.00 $71.80

Cascade Tom Irwin Tom Irwin, Inc. 5 $895.00 $179.00

Dispatch (spray) Aquatrols The Charles C. Hart Seed Co. 30 $3,373.50 $112.45

Dispatch (Injectable) Aquatrols

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 

Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 30 $1,240.00 55 $2,270.00 $41.33

Exchange Tom Irwin Tom Irwin, Inc. 5 $375.00 $75.00

Fleet Harrells Harrell's, LLC 5 $497.84 30 $2,884.00 $99.57

Mariner Ocean Organics

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 

Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 30 $2,305.00 275 $20,075.00 $76.83

Nautilus Ocean Organics

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 

Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 30 $3,498.00 $116.60

Privateer Ocean Organics

Atlantic Golf and Turf an 

Advanced Turf Solutions Co. 30 $2,850.00 $95.00

Proxy Bayer Heritage PPG 5 $157.97 $31.59

Sea‐3 Earthworks Tom Irwin, Inc. 5 $425.00 $85.00

Tinexapac‐ethyl Several Nutrien Ag Solutions 1 $94.38 $94.38

Trilogy Earthworks Tom Irwin, Inc. 5 $499.00 $99.80

Vivax Tom Irwin Tom Irwin, Inc. 5 $745.00 $149.00

DRY PRODUCTS

LIQUID PRODUCTS



Contract BC-25-8073
Golf Course Products

Brand Vendor Percent Off Total Percent Off
Par-Aide Hornung's Golf Products, Inc. 12% 12%
Fore-Par No Bid
Standard Golf Hornung's Golf Products, Inc. 15% 15%
John Deere R&R No bid
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